
DIVISION 40 

FIRE AND LIFE SAFETY REGULATIONS 

837-040-0010  

Adoption of the International Fire Code 

(1) The Oregon Fire Code is generally adopted every three years coinciding with the publication 

of a nationally recognized fire code.  

(2) Effective July 1, 2010 April 1, 2014 the 2010 2014 Oregon Fire Code is the 2009 2012 

edition of the International Fire Code, as published by the International Code Council, and as 

amended by the Office of State Fire Marshal. (Referenced publications are available for review 

at the agency. See agency web site for information on where to purchase publications.)  

(3)(a) For the purposes of new construction plan review only a phase-in period is being 

implemented for the 2010 Oregon Fire Code, the 2007 2010 Oregon Fire Code is adopted for a 

period of 90-days beginning July 1, 2010 April 1, 2014 and ending September 30, 2010 2014.  

(b) During the 90-day phase-in period established in subsection (3)(a), new construction plan 

review will be done to either the 2010 2014 Oregon Fire Code or the 2007 2010 Oregon Fire 

Code as directed by the local building official.  

Stat. Auth: ORS 476.030 

Stats. Implemented: ORS 476.030 

Hist.: FM 3-1986, f. & ef. 3-11-86; FM 5-1986 (corrects FM 3-1986), f. & ef. 4-30-86 & Renumbered from 837-

040-0005, Sec. (3) Uniform Fire Code; FM 3-1989, f. 6-30-89, cert. ef. 7-1-89; FM 6-1990, f. & cert. ef. 9-13-90; 

F)M 6-1992, f. 6-15-92, cert. ef. 7-15-92; FM 2-1996, f. 1-22-96, cert. ef. 4-1-96; OSFM 1-1998, f. & cert. ef. 4-30-

98; OSFM 3-1998, f. & cert. ef. 9-30-98; OSFM 4-1999, f. 12-29-99, cert. ef. 1-1-00; OSFM 3-2000, f. 4-1-00, cert. 

ef. 5-1-00; OSFM 13-2000, f. 10-3-00, cert. ef. 11-1-00; OSFM 9-2001, f. 10-3-01, cert. ef. 2-1-02; OSFM 4-2004, 

f. 3-26-04, cert. ef. 10-1-04; OSFM 8-2004(Temp), f. 12-29-04, cert. ef. 1-3-05 thru 6-30-05; OSFM 11-2005, f. & 

cert. ef. 6-27-05; OSFM 1-2006(Temp), f. 1-9-06 cert. ef. 2-1-06 thru 7-28-06; OSFM 9-2006, f. & cert. ef. 6-12-06; 

OSFM 13-2006, f. 12-1-06, cert. ef. 4-1-07; OSFM 4-2009, f. 11-19-09, cert. ef. 4-1-10; OSFM 2-2010(Temp), f. 2-

3-10, cert. ef. 7-1-10 thru 9-30-10; Administrative correction 10-26-10; OSFM 4-2010, f. & cert. ef. 11-3-10  

837-040-0020  

Amendments to the Oregon Fire Code 

(1) The Office of State Fire Marshal may amend the Oregon Fire Code approximately midway 

between publications of the International Fire Code based on proposed code amendments 

submitted for consideration by interested persons. 

(2) Any time between publications of the international Fire Code, the Office of State Fire 

Marshal may initiate and adopt code amendments to the Oregon Fire Code, as circumstances 

merit (Referenced publications are available for review at the agency. See agency web site for 

information on where to purchase publications).  



(3) Effective April 1, 2011, the 2010 Oregon Fire Code (OFC) is amended by the Office of State 

Fire Marshal as follows:  

(a) Add new section 908.7, Carbon Monoxide alarms, to correlate with the change to the 2010 

Oregon Structural Specialty Code.  

(b) Amend Chapter 47, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standards and 

Underwriters Laboratories Standards, as follows:  

NFPA 720-09 Standard for the Installation of Carbon Monoxide (CO) Detection and Warning 

Equipment -- 908.7.  

UL 2034-08 Standard for single and Multiple Station Carbon Monoxide Alarms, with revisions 

through February 20, 2009 -- 908.7.  

(4) Effective January 1, 2012, the 2010 Oregon Fire Code (OFC) is amended by the Office of 

State Fire Marshal as follows:  

(a) Amend Section 202, Definitions for Group R-3 Occupancy to correlate to the Oregon 

Structural Specialty Code, Section 310.  

(b) Amend Section 510.2.2 by adding the words "at the agency's antenna port" after -100 dBm 

and before shall be received.  

(c) Amend Section 906.1 by using language from the 2012 International Fire Code.  

(d) Amend Section 914.8.2 by adding a second exception to correlate to the Oregon Structural 

Specialty Codes, Section 412.4.5.  

(e) Amend Section 4001.1, Exception 3 by adding "and SR" occupancies.  

(f) Amend Section 4006.1 by adding "and SR" occupancies.  

(g) Amend Section 4604.17 by updating with language from 2012 International Fire Code.  

(h) Amend Chapter 47, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standards, to current 

editions as follows:  

(A) NFPA 10 to the 2010 edition.  

(B) NFPA 13, 13R and 13D to the 2010 edition.  

(C) NFPA 17 to the 2009 edition.  

(D) NFPA 17A to the 2009 edition.  



(E) NFPA 20 to the 2010 edition.  

(F) NFPA 58 to the 2011 edition.  

(G) NFPA 72 to the 2010 edition.  

(H) NFPA 96 to the 2011 edition.  

[Publications: Publications referenced are available from the agency.]  

Stat. Auth: ORS 476.030  

Stats. Implemented: ORS 476.030  

Hist.: OSFM 1-2006(Temp), f. 1-9-06 cert. ef. 2-1-06 thru 7-28-06; OSFM 9-2006, f. & cert. ef. 6-12-06; OSFM 13-

2006, f. 12-1-06, cert. ef. 4-1-07; OSFM 6-2008, f. 9-2-08, cert. ef. 10-1-08; OSFM 10-2008, f. 12-18-09, cert. ef. 

12-31-09; OSFM 4-2009, f. 11-19-09, cert. ef. 4-1-10; OSFM 2-2010(Temp), f. 2-3-10, cert. ef. 7-1-10 thru 9-30-10; 

Administrative correction 10-26-10; OSFM 4-2010, f. & cert. ef. 11-3-10; OSFM 2-2011, f. 3-15-11, cert. ef. 4-1-

11; OSFM 4-2011, f. 11-10-11, cert. ef. 1-1-12; OSFM 2-2012, f. 1-24-12, cert. ef. 3-1-12; OSFM 5-2012(Temp), f. 

& cert. ef. 2-10-12 thru 8-3-12; OSFM 7-2012, f. 5-16-12, cert. ef. 8-2-12 

837-040-0140 

Adoption of the Oregon Structural Specialty Code and Oregon Mechanical Specialty Code 

The fire and life safety provisions of the 2010 2014 edition of the Oregon Structural Specialty 

Code and the 2010 2014 edition of the Oregon Mechanical Specialty Code is hereby adopted as a 

standard for the purpose of evaluation of existing buildings. (Referenced publications are 

available for review at the agency. See Building Codes Division web site for information on 

where to purchase publications.)  

Stat. Auth.: ORS 476.030 

Stats. Implemented: ORS 476.030 

Hist.: OSFM 1-1998, f. & cert. ef. 4-30-98; OSFM 9-2001, f. 10-3-01, cert. ef. 2-1-02; OSFM 4-2004, f. 3-26-04, 

cert. ef. 10-1-04; OSFM 1-2006(Temp), f. 1-9-06 cert. ef. 2-1-06 thru 7-28-06; OSFM 9-2006, f. & cert. ef. 6-12-06; 

OSFM 13-2006, f. 12-1-06, cert. ef. 4-1-07; OSFM 4-2009, f. 11-19-09, cert. ef. 4-1-10; OSFM 2-2010(Temp), f. 2-

3-10, cert. ef. 7-1-10 thru 9-30-10; Administrative correction 10-26-10; OSFM 4-2010, f. & cert. ef. 11-3-10  

 


